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Osteoporosis 2019
12th International Conference on Osteoporosis,
Arthritis and Musculoskeletal Disorders was
organized during March 13-14, 2019 at London, UK
with the support and contribution of the Organizing
Committee Members.

Firstly, we must thank you for trusting us and
participating in Osteoporosis 2019, a global platform to
discuss various important aspects of Osteoporosis,
Arthritis and Musculoskeletal Disorders.

There are infinite reasons to extend our gratitude to you
for making the Osteoporosis 2019 outstanding
conference. We couldn't have done it without your
continuous support and believe towards our
organization, which mutually made to achieve
Osteoporosis 2019 a new height in the field of
Osteoporosis.

The conference was marked with the attendance of
young and brilliant researchers, business delegates and
talented student communities representing more than 15
countries, who have driven this event into the path of
success.

The conference was organized around the theme
“Exceeding the Vision in Osteoporosis”. The event
implanted a firm relation of upcoming strategies in the
field of Osteoporosis, Arthritis and Musculoskeletal
Disorders. The conceptual and applicable knowledge
shared, will also foster organizational collaborations to
nurture scientific accelerations.

The conference proceedings were carried out through
various Scientific-sessions and plenary lectures, of
which the following Speakers were highlighted as
Keynote speakers:

Ravichandran Subbaraj, NMC Day Surgery Centre,
UAE

Anthony Cavazos, Madison Medical & Sports
Rehabilitation Center, USA

Michael Borsky, Etzelclinic, Switzerland

Wagih El Masri, Keele University, UK

The conference witnessed an amalgamation of peerless
speeches, Keynote speakers, well-known researchers
and delegates who enlightened the crowd with their
enviable research knowledge and on various alluring
topics related to the field of Osteoporosis and various
rheumatic disorders by their fabulous presentations at
the podium of Osteoporosis 2019.

Pulsus Group offers its heartfelt appreciation to all the
Organizing Committee Members, Chairs and Co-chairs,
Speakers, Students, Media Partners, sponsors and
Editorial Board Members of Journal of Journal of
Orthopaedics Trauma Surgery and Related Research,
International Journal of Clinical Rheumatology, Journal
of Emergency and Trauma Care, who supported the
conference in every aspect for the awe-inspiring
exhibition at the venue.

We are also obliged to various delegate experts,
company representatives and other eminent
personalities who supported the conference by
facilitating active discussion forums. We sincerely
thank our Organizing Committee Members.

So, as a continuation of Osteoporosis 2019, we would
like to heartily invite you to our upcoming 13th

International Conference on Osteoporosis, Arthritis and
Musculoskeletal Disorders scheduled during April 08-09,
2020 at Dubai, UAE.

For 2019 we are expanding our focus towards all
aspects of Osteoporosis, Arthritis and Musculoskeletal
Disorders and Research findings as treatment methods.
Our organizing committee is gearing up for more
innovative and explorative sessions to unleash the
boundaries of the Osteoporosis 2019.

Your expertise and knowledge in the area of
Osteoporosis 2019 will provide an opportunity to
discuss and respond to a series of questions about the
status of advanced Osteoporosis.
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We would like to organize this conference with your
support to gather all the Osteoporosis researchers in a
single platform, hope we will be honoured with your
support to organize Osteoporosis 2020 in a grand level,
your support will be the key of success for our next year
conference.

We look forward to seeing your benign presence with
active contribution and support to make this event
successful once more.

Once again, it’s our pleasure to welcome you to our
upcoming Osteoporosis 2020.
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